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 HARFORD COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 
 

 PURCHASING BID REPORT 
 

Bid #: 09-JMH-032 Date of Bid 

Advertisement: 

5/14/09 

Bid Title: Recycling Container for Various Schools & 
Offices 

Bid Opening: 6/9/09 

Date Bid 

Released: 

5/14/09 

Bid Sent: 6 

 # of Companies 

 
 
DESCRIPTION OF BID:     
Recycling Containers for Schools & Offices 

 
USING DEPARTMENTS: 
 

 Food Service               Warehouse Stock 

 Maintenance               New Construction 

 Operations                            Project:  

 Transportation               Other:  

 Various Schools                                                  

                                                                  

                                           BID TABULATION 
 
   

BID NUMBER 09-JMH-032 

BID TITLE Recycling Containers for Various Schools and 
Offices 

DATE OF AWARD  

LENGTH OF CONTRACT  
 

                              BIDDERS                                                AMOUNT 

**See attached  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  
 

 
 
 

CONTRACT AWARDED TO: 

FPC Distribution/S. Freedman & Sons, Inc. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ESTIMATED VALUE OF CONTRACT: 
 

$39,401.88 

 
 

 
 

METHOD OF AWARD:     Individual Items        Group         Total Contract     Other 

BUYER'S COMMENTS:     
 
 
 
 
 
BUYER:    _____________________________________________________                                             
                       Signature                     Date               
 
APPROVALS: 
 
Signature:                                                       _____                     _______                
                    SUPERVISOR OF PURCHASING     DATE  
 

 



Created 3/23/07 

 
HARFORD COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

PURCHASING OFFICE 
 

Formal Bid Opening 

 

Bid Title: Recycling Containers for Various Schools and Offices 

Bid #: 09-JMH-032 

Bid Opening Date: June 9, 2009 

Time: 2:30 PM 

 

 

 

Bids Received 
Grand Total 

Without HCPS Imprint 
Grand Total With HCPS Imprint 

Fitch Co. $49,230.00 $56,867.76 

Grainger $41,570.72 $45,888.36 

Waste Management No Bid $47,074.45 

Kleen O Rama $45,836.60 $48,129.52 

S. Freedman & Sons $35,535.92 $37,807.88 

Toter Incorporated No Bid No Bid 

Mill Supply Company $41,173.52 $43,696.52 

HD Supply $43,275.76 $45,940.88 

Waste Wise Products $25,798.64 $26,960.64 

Global Equipment $39,718.48 $42,175.28 

C & H $42,361.24 $43,493.96 

Paidon Products $23,026.36 $41,714.36 

FPC Distribution $22,013.44 $39,892.68 

BW Interiors $40,903.84 $40,903.84 

Office Depot $43,068.36 $45,705.24 

 

  



Created 3/23/07 

 

Bid #09-JMH-032 Recycle Containers for Various Schools & Offices  

 
 Line Item Bid Tab  

 

    

Company 

 14 Gallon Unit Price 

w/out HCPS Imprint  

 32 Gallon Unit Price 

w/out HCPS Imprint  

 Grand Total w/out 

HCPS Imprint  

FPC Distribution  $                7.21   $              12.31   $        22,013.44  

Paidon Products Co  $                7.54   $              12.89   $        23,026.36  
Waste Wise 
Products  $                7.94   $              18.36   $        25,798.64  
S. Freedman & 
Sons  $              11.90   $              17.64   $        35,535.92  

Kleen o Rama  $              12.71   $              43.40   $        45,836.60  

BW Interiors  $              13.36   $              23.16   $        40,903.84  

Global Industrial  $              13.39   $              19.27   $        39,718.48  

Mill Supply Co Inc  $              13.88   $              19.98   $        41,173.52  

C & H Distributors  $              13.93   $              23.26   $        42,361.24  

Grainger  $              14.00   $              20.28   $        41,570.72  

Office Depot  $              14.52   $              20.84   $        43,052.16  

HD Supply  $              14.59   $              20.99   $        43,275.76  

Fitch Co.  $              16.29   $              26.25   $        49,230.00  

Waste Management  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  

Toter Incorporated  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  

    

    

Company 

 14 Gallon Unit Price 

w/ HCPS Imprint  

 32 Gallon Unit Price 

w/ HCPS Imprint  

 Grand Total w/ 

HCPS Imprint  

Waste Wise 
Products  $                8.34   $              18.86   $        26,960.64  
S. Freedman & 
Sons  $              12.57   $              19.46   $        37,807.88  

FPC Distribution  $              12.87   $              23.82   $        39,892.68  

BW Interiors  $              13.36   $              23.16   $        40,903.84  

Kleen o Rama  $              13.39   $              45.23   $        48,129.52  

Paidon Products Co  $              13.46   $              24.89   $        41,714.36  

Global Industrial  $              14.12   $              21.22   $        42,175.28  

C & H Distributors  $              14.12   $              25.29   $        43,493.96  

Mill Supply Co Inc  $              14.63   $              21.98   $        43,696.52  

Grainger  $              15.00   $              25.89   $        45,888.36  

Office Depot  $              15.30   $              23.01   $        45,705.24  

HD Supply  $              15.38   $              23.12   $        45,940.88  

Waste Management  $              15.44   $              26.17   $        47,079.08  

Fitch Co.  $              18.99   $              28.99   $        56,867.76  

Toter Incorporated  No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  

 

 

 

 


